Tax Claim Bureau of Mifflin County September 9, 2025

2025 Upset Sale

Results

Tax Map No. Property Owner Control # Property Location Starting Bid Final Bid
01,14-0203--,000 Aurelio Hernandez 10-57903 8 Woods Ln S 3,802.92 | sold
01,15-0311--,000 Glenn Kephart Sr 10-780806 128 W Fourth St S 6,847.69 | no bid
02 ,01-0207--,000 William T Searer & Tonya Malysza 20-33387 140 W Fifth St S 13,360.42 | sold
04 ,03-0256--,000 Muwaffaq Alradaideh 40-74930 9 Montgomery Ave S 7,296.57 | no bid
05 ,04-0520--,000 Anastasia 1031 Capital 50-782292 18 1/2 Locust St S 6,894.39 | no bid
05,09-0404--,000 Edward laccarino 50-12351 623 Valley St S 2,873.71 | no bid
05,11-0403--,000 Ellis & Elsie Snyder 50-54916 Lot 25-Oakland Ave S 1,293.05 | sold
05,11-0404--,000 Ellis & Elsie Snyder 50-54917 27 Oakland Ave S 5,665.99 | sold
05,13-0410--,000 Tressa Hess 50-158820 628 E Walnut St S 10,125.36 | no bid
09,02-0500G-,000 Samuel Diven 90-15333 438 Nolan Rd S 7,591.61 | sold
10,00-0702--,000 Ernest Pollock Jr 100-785274 |20 S Water St S 7,385.15 | sold
11,01-0010--,001 Donald Atherton & Janet Smith 110-1810 21 Briggs St S 1,029.28 | no bid
12 ,19-0109C-,000 Arlene Chaudhry 120-230450 |3475 New Lancaster Valley S 6,493.49 | sold
12,22-0235--,000 Dary! & Linda Treaster 120-787082 |73 Electric Ave S 7,324.17 | sold
12,24-0319C-,001 Scott Wagner 120-320759 |126 Broad St S 1,262.37 | no bid
12,24-0308--,000 Scott Wagner 120-482539 |217 College Ave S 4,686.13 | no bid
12,23-0305--,006 Matthew Woodring 120-787159 |9 Shawna Dr S 1,783.92 | no bid
15,01-0103D-,000 Howard Confer 150-791099 |Hummels Lane S 2,593.60 | no bid
15,13-0113--,005 Jacqueline Druckemiller 150-175041 |22 Mail Pouch Rd S 653.47 | sold
15,04-0105--,000 Mark Fike 150-246603 2940 Back Maitland Rd S 6,745.30 | no bid
15,21-0100--,000 Zachary Rossman 150-71945 5016 Back Maitland Rd S 3,850.21 | no bid
15,02-0112D-,000 Zachary & Christine Rossman 150-327946 |Alfarata Rd S 3,715.14 | sold
15,02-0112E-,000 Zachary & Christine Rossman 150-327947 |Sheds off of Alfarata Rd S 3,004.98 | sold
16 ,41-0180--,000 John & Helen Beaver 160-796861 [1916 Glenwood Ave S 5,609.64 | sold
16,13-0100--,036 Shawn Coudriet 160-47389 100 Hillside Terr-Lot 3 S 2,159.01 | no bid
16,29-0541--,000 Alden & Denelle Gisewhite 160-760381  |400 Columbia St S 1,838.68 | sold
16,24-0301--,000 Raymond & Cathy Guthridge 160-217179 |102 N Main St S 6,280.62 | no bid
16 ,24-0408--,000 Raymond & Cathy Guthridge 160-233926 |213 N Main St S 6,989.14 | sold
16,35-0409--,000 Cathy Ann Mccalips 160-63231 2134 Back Maitland Rd S 18,528.12 | no bid
16 ,29-0328--,000 Ashley Reeder 160-45662 403 Rear Green Ave ext S 5,928.98 | sold
16,03-0124B-,000 Michael Tate Jr 160-793210 |220 Ewardtown Rd S 23,229.07 | sold
17 ,18-0116--,000 Billie Brotemarkle 170-521167 |6356 Belle Ave S 3,977.52 | sold
17 ,21-0316--,000 Russell Harlon IH 170-286974 146 Klondyke Dr S 3,130.15 | no bid
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17,19-0122--,000 Derrick Stine 170-799057 |72 Hawsbrick St S 1,376.30 | no bid
19,09-0102--,041 Darren & Mandy Lynn 190 -807214 |Lot 89 S 444.01 | no bid
20,13-0510--,003 Dennis Dittsworth & Jason Grubb 200-320678 |4501 E Main St Lot B8 S 1,113.98 | no bid
20,16-0181--,000 David Stroup 200-804271 [308 Trella St S 8,382.82 | sold
20,01-0137A-,000 Robin Yetter 200-802931 |Lot off of Greenwood Rd S 944.53 | sold
21,19-0523--,000 William Kidd 210-200773 |90 Memorial Rd S 2,744.97 | sold
21,20-0110A-,000 Michelle Shumaker 210-333886 (4297 SR 103 S S 2,906.30 | sold




